UEE
Legislative Council

LC Paper No. CB(3) 685/08-09

Ref : CB(3)/B/FST/3 (08-09)

Tel : 2869 9206

Date : 12 June 2009

From : Clerk to the Legislative Council

To : All Members of the Legislative Council

Council meeting on 24 June 2009
Inland Revenue (Amendment) Bill 2009
Committee Stage Amendments
The Second Reading debate on the above Bill will be resumed on
24 June 2009. Subject to the bill receiving a Second Reading, the President has
given permission for the Secretary for Financial Services and the Treasury to

move amendments to the Bill at its Committee stage.

2. As directed by the President, the amendments are attached for
Members’ consideration.

(Ms Dora WAI)
for Clerk to the Legislative Council

Encl.



INLAND REVENUE (AMENDMENT) BILL 2009

COMMITTEE STAGE

Amendments to be moved by the Secretary for Financial Services and the Treasury

Clause

Long title

Amendment Proposed

By deleting “in the Budget introduced by the Government for the
2009-2010 financial year” and substituting “by the Government in

2009”.

(a) In the proposed Schedule 19, in section 1(a), by deleting
“50%” and substituting “100%”.

(b) In the proposed Schedule 19, in section 1(54), by deleting
“$6,000” and substituting “$8,000”.

() In the proposed Schedule 19, in section 2(1)(a), by deleting
“50%"” and substituting “100%”.

(d) In the proposed Schedule 19, in section 2(1)(5), by deleting
“$6,000” and substituting “$8,000”.



