VAE
Legislative Council

LC Paper No. CB(3) 56/18-19

Ref : CB(3)/B/LW/1 (17-18)

Tel : 39193308

Date : 22 October 2018

From : Clerk to the Legislative Council

To : All Members of the Legislative Council

Council meeting of 24 October 2018
Amendments to Employment (Amendment) Bill 2018

Members were informed vide LC Paper No. CB(3) 24/18-19
issued on 11 October 2018 that the President had given permission for the
Secretary for Labour and Welfare to move amendment to the Bill.

2. Members are invited to note that the President has also given
permission for the following Members, subject to the Bill receiving
Second Reading, to move their proposed amendments:

Mover of amendment(s) Appendix
(set out in the order of receipt)

Hon LEUNG Yiu-chung

Dr Hon Fernando CHEUNG
Hon Gary FAN

Hon HUI Chi-fung

Dr Hon Helena WONG

OB WN -

3. As directed by the President, the amendments are attached for
Members’ consideration.

(Judy TING)
for Clerk to the Legislative Council

I'I'I
S
Q



Appendix 1
Employment (Amendment) Bill 2018
Committee Stage

Amendments to be moved by the Honourable LEUNG Yiu-chung

Clause Amendment Proposed

Long title By deleting  “5 days” and substituting “7 days” .

3(1) In the proposed section 15E(2)(b)(ii), by deleting “5 days™ and
substituting “7 days” .



Appendix 2

Employment (Amendment) Bill 2018
Committee Stage

Amendments to be moved by Dr. the Honourable Fernando CHEUNG Chiu-hung

Clause Amendment Proposed
Long title By deleting “5 days” and substituting “7 days”.
3(1) In the proposed section 15E(2)(b)(ii), by deleting “5 days” and

substituting “7 days”.



Appendix 3
Employment (Amendment) Bill 2018

Committee Stage

Amendments to be moved by the Honourable Gary FAN Kwok-wai

Clause Amendment Proposed

Long title By deleting “from 3 days to 5 days” and substituting “from 3
days to 7 days”.

3(2) In the proposed section 15E(2)(b)(ii), by deleting “5 days”
and substituting “7 days”.



Appendix 4
Employment (Amendment) Bill 2018

Committee Stage

Amendments to be moved by the Honourable HUI Chi-fung

Clause Amendment Proposed

Long title By deleting “from 3 days to 5 days” and
substituting “from 3 days to 7 days”.

3(1) In the proposed section 15E(2)(b)(ii), by deleting
“5 days” and substituting “7 days”.



Employment (Amendment) Bill 2018 Appendix 5

Committee Stage

Amendments to be moved by Dr. the Honourable Helena WONG

Clause

Long title

3(1)

Pik-wan

Amendment Proposed

By deleting “from 3 days to 5 days in respect of a
child born on or after the commencement date
appointed by the Secretary for Labour and Welfare
for this Ordinance” and substituting “from 3 days to
7 days progressively”.

In the proposed section 15E(2)(b) ——
(@  In subparagraph (i), by deleting “; or” and

substituting a semicolon;

(b) by deleting subparagraph (i) and
substituting—

“(i) for a child born on or after the
commencement  date  of  the
Employment (Amendment)
Ordinance 2018 ( of 2018) but
before the expiry of the period of 1
year from that commencement
date—b5 days; or

(iti) for a child born on or after the expiry
of the period of 1 year from that
commencement date—7 days,”.



	CB(3) 56e_18-19[Members' amendments]
	Appendix 1 (LEUNG Yiu-chung)_e
	Appendix 2 (Fernando CHEUNG)_e
	Appendix 3 (Gary FAN)_e
	Appendix 4 (HUI Chi-fung)_e
	Appendix 5 (Helena WONG)_e

