
立法會 
Legislative Council 

 
LC Paper No. CB(3) 351/18-19 

 
Ref : CB(3)/B/FST/6 (17-18) 
 
Tel : 3919 3308 
 
Date : 24 January 2019 
 
From : Clerk to the Legislative Council 
 
To : All Members of the Legislative Council 
 
 
 

Council meeting of 30 January 2019 
 

Amendments to Financial Reporting Council (Amendment) Bill 2018 
 
 Members were informed vide LC Paper No. CB(3) 347/18-19 
issued on 23 January 2019 that the President had given permission for the 
Secretary for Financial Services and the Treasury to move amendments to 
the Bill.  Members are invited to note that the President has also given 
permission for Hon Kenneth LEUNG, subject to the Bill receiving Second 
Reading, to move amendments to the Bill as set out in Appendices 1, 2 
and 3. 
 
2. As directed by the President, the amendments are attached for 
Members’ consideration. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 (Judy TING) 
 for Clerk to the Legislative Council 
 
Encl. 



 
Financial Reporting Council (Amendment) Bill 2018 

 
Committee Stage  

 
Amendments to be moved by the Honourable Kenneth LEUNG 

 

Clause Amendment Proposed 

48 In the proposed section 37D(3)(b)(iv)(A), by deleting 
“$10,000,000” and substituting “$1,000,000”.  
 

48 In the proposed section 37E(3)(b)(iii)(A), by deleting 
“$10,000,000” and substituting “$1,000,000”.  

  

  

  

 

Appendix 1 



 
Financial Reporting Council (Amendment) Bill 2018 

 
Committee Stage  

 
Amendments to be moved by the Honourable Kenneth LEUNG 

 

Clause Amendment Proposed 

48 In the proposed section 37D(3)(b)(iv)(A), by deleting 
“$10,000,000” and substituting “$5,000,000”.  
 

48 In the proposed section 37E(3)(b)(iii)(A), by deleting 
“$10,000,000” and substituting “$5,000,000”.  

  

  

  

 

Appendix 2 



 
Financial Reporting Council (Amendment) Bill 2018 

 
Committee Stage  

 
Amendments to be moved by the Honourable Kenneth LEUNG 

 

Clause Amendment Proposed 

48 In the proposed section 37D(3)(b)(iv)(A), by deleting 
“$10,000,000” and substituting “$8,000,000”.  
 

48 In the proposed section 37E(3)(b)(iii)(A), by deleting 
“$10,000,000” and substituting “$8,000,000”.  

  

  

  

 

Appendix 3 


	CB(3) 351e_18-19[Hon Kenneth LEUNG]
	CB(3) 351e_18-19[Appendix 1]
	CB(3) 351e_18-19[Appendix 2]
	CB(3) 351e_18-19[Appendix 3] 

